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COVER LETTER

Dear Ms. Bowles,

I am writing to express my interest in the After School 
Teacher position at Rosemary Works School. With 3 years 
of experience in teaching and a passion for working with 
children, I am confident that I would be a valuable addition 
to your team.

In my previous role as an After School Teacher at St. Mary's 
Academy, I have developed excellent classroom manage-
ment skills and fostered positive relationships with both stu-
dents and parents. I am experienced in creating engaging 
lesson plans and implementing them effectively to ensure 
each student's academic growth. 

My ability to communicate effectively with students of dif-
ferent ages and learning styles has been one of my biggest 
achievements in this role.

What sets me apart from other candidates is my enthu-
siasm for creating a fun and nurturing learning environ-
ment for children. I believe that every child is unique and 
deserves individual attention to reach their full potential. 
My biggest achievement as an After School Teacher has 
been helping students develop their critical thinking skills, 
self-confidence, and a love for learning.

I am excited about the opportunity to bring my skills and 
experience to the After School Teacher role at Rosemary 
Works School. Thank you for considering my application. I 
look forward to discussing how my qualifications make me 
a strong candidate.

Sincerely,

Don A. Patterson

DETAILS

+1 574-993-9725

donpatterson@email.com

3657 Luke Lane, South Bend, 
IN, 46601
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